
JAMES
THE BOOK OF

RECAP: Have 1 to 2 people in 
your team share something that 
stuck out to them from tonights 
message. Share an example with 
your team a time when someones 
encouragement really affected 
you & why you remember it.

READ: James 3:8- discuss the 
heaviness of this verse. Why is 
controlling our tongue so import-
ant? Our words are powerful- how 
will this affect your speech 
moving forward?

REFLECT: The words that come 
out of our mouth are a true reflec-
tion of what’s in our heart- how 
can we fill our heart with things 
that are honoring to God? 

REMEMBER: Wisdom is a huge 
part of our speech. How does 
worldliness play into the way 
that we talk? Why do you think 
this is important? ALSO Have 
your group work to memorize our 
verse for this series, which is 
James 2:James 2:17. 

REQUEST: Use this time to en-
courage one another. Come up 
with a game plan for how you can 
use your words to build up the 
people around you!
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